Exhibit A

Date	Timekeeper	Hours	Hourly Rate	Amount Billed	Description of Work Performed
12/21/23	CJ	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00	Review and analysis of draft P memo in support of atty fees. Coordination with cocounsel re same.
12/20/23	TE	5.5	\$625.00	\$3,437.50	Draft fee motion and declaration
12/8/23	TE	0.1	\$625.00	\$62.50	Review and discuss email regarding notice and opt-outs
11/12/23	TE	1	\$625.00	\$625.00	Emails with class administrator regarding notice and sufficiency of documents
10/13/23	CJ	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00	Review and analysis of Ct order granting preliminary approval. Coordination with cocounsel
10/3/23	TE	1.1	\$625.00	\$687.50	Prepare for and attend preliminary approval hearing (telephonic)
8/7/23	TE	2.5	\$625.00	\$1,562.50	Prepare supplemental letter to preliminary approval motion, revise, file
8/4/23	CJ	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00	Review and analysis of draft letter brief to Ct re additional info for preliminary approval.
7/27/23	CJ	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00	Review and analysis of Ct text order requesting additional info re preliminary approval.
7/24/23	CJ	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00	Review and analysis of final drafts of

					preliminary approval
					papers. Coordination
					with co-counsel re
= /0.0 /0.0	+		4	4	filing.
7/20/23	CJ	0.6	\$750.00	\$450.00	Review, analysis, and
					proposed edits to
					draft preliminary
					approval papers.
7/20/23	Cl	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00	Coordination with co-
					counsel and defense
					counsel re final draft
					of SA and signatures.
7/19/23	TE	6.9	\$625.00	\$4,312.50	Draft motion and
					related documents
					for preliminary
					approval
7/18/23	TE	6	\$625.00	\$3,750.00	Draft motion for
	<u> </u>				preliminary approval
7/17	TE	3	\$625.00	\$1,875.00	Draft motion for
					preliminary approval,
					including initial
					review and research.
7/6/23	CJ	0.1	\$750.00	\$75.00	Coordination with co-
					counsel re drafting
					preliminary approval
					papers.
6/27/23	WH	0.6	\$400.00	\$240.00	Prepare letter to
					court for extension of
					time due to pending
					settlement
					negotiations.
6/20/23	CJ	0.5	\$750.00	\$375.00	Review and analysis
-,,					of draft SA.
					Coordination with co-
					counsel re same.
5/22/23	CJ	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00	Coordination with co-
-, -=, -=					counsel and defense
					counsel re status of
					draft SA.
5/22/23	TE	1.4	\$625.00	\$875.00	Settlement
3, 22, 23	'-	1	7525.00	45,5.00	agreement
					negotiations
					าเอซอนเสนอกร

4/28/23	CJ	0.1	\$750.00	\$75.00	Coordination with co- counsel re provision of status report to the Court.
4/26/23	CJ	0.1	\$750.00	\$75.00	Review of mediator's notice to the court. Coordination with cocounsel re same.
4/26/23	CJ	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00	Review of mediators proposal. Coordination with cocounsel re same.
4/21/23	CJ	6	\$750.00	\$4,500.00	Prep and attendance of mediation, including call with cocounsel following mediation.
4/20/23	CJ	0.1	\$750.00	\$75.00	Coordination with co- counsel re mediation schedule.
4/14/23	TE	3	\$625.00	\$1,875.00	Updates to mediation statement
4/13/23	CJ	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00	Review and analysis of draft mediation statement. Coordination with cocounsel re same.
4/13/23	TE	2	\$625.00	\$1,250.00	Work on mediation statement, including research of new bank fee orders and arbitration considerations
4/12/23	TE	1.4	\$625.00	\$875.00	Mediation preparation
3/3/23	CJ	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00	Coordination with co- counsel re potential mediation.
2/14/23	CJ	0.1	\$750.00	\$75.00	Review and analysis of D initial disclosures.
2/14/23	CJ	0.1	\$750.00	\$75.00	Review of draft of P initial disclosures.

					Coordination with TE
					re same.
1/30/23	TE	5	\$625.00	\$3,125.00	Receive and review informal production of documents and transactional data
1/26/23	CJ	0.1	\$750.00	\$75.00	Coordination with co- counsel re scheduling of data production and mediation.
1/20/23	CJ	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00	Review and analysis of D Answer.
1/20/23	TE	3	\$625.00	\$1,875.00	Call with D counsel regarding CMP, draft and revise CMP
12/20/22	TE	0.9	\$625.00	\$562.50	Review notice of attorney admission and execute next steps
12/12/22	CJ	0.1	\$750.00	\$75.00	Review and analysis of Ct scheduling order. Coordination with co-counsel re same.
12/6/22	CJ	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00	Review of D financial information. Coordination with cocounsel re potential damages.
12/5/22	CJ	0.1	\$750.00	\$75.00	Coordination with co- counsel re CMC.
12/5/22	TE	2	\$625.00	\$1,250.00	Perform rough damages analysis
10/25/22	CJ	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00	Coordination with co- counsel re general status of case, D appearances, and potential extension.
9/23/22	CJ	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00	Coordination with JF staff and TE re atty admissions for case.
9/22/22	TE	1	\$625.00	\$625.00	Review notice of attorney admission

					and execute next steps
9/21/22	CI	0.1	\$750.00	\$75.00	Coordination with co- counsel re service of CAC.
9/19/22	CI	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00	Coordination with co- counsel re filing of CAC.
9/13/22	TE	5.9	\$625.00	\$3,687.50	Draft Complaint and Discovery
9/13/22	CJ	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00	Review and analysis of draft CAC. Coordination with cocounsel re approval and filing.
9/10/22	CI	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00	Coordination with co- counsel re client information and records.
9/10/22	TE	3	\$625.00	\$1,875.00	Review client statements and account agreements for claim(s)
TOTALS		67.5		\$43,577.50	